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(01. 95-31) 7 ‘Claims. 

This invention relates to photography and 
more particularly to improvements in double ex 
posure prevention devices of the type including 
connections between a film-winding mechanism 
and a shutter. One object of my invention is to 
provide a double-exposure mechanism in which 
the shutter trigger operates noiselessly in an 
exposure-making direction until the exposure is 
made. Another object of my invention is to 
provide connections between a trigger-latching 
mechanism and a, ?lm-winding mechanism which 
will operate in such a manner that there is but 
little chance of even an inexperienced camera 
operator operating the mechanism in an im 
proper manner. A still further object of my in 
vention is to provide a simple, inexpensive, and 
readily assembled mechanism which will elimi 
nate double exposures even in the hands of in 
experienced operators. 
This application is for an improvement over 

the double-exposure prevention camera shown 
in U. S. Patent 2,367,504, Hutchison, Jr., granted 
January 16, 1945, and the shutter of this camera 
which is shown in his Patent 2,423,706, granted 
July 8, 1947. In the ?rst-mentioned patent, the 
mechanism worked satisfactorily and reliably un 
der normal operating conditions. However, 
certain camera operators could press the trig 
ger very slowly and, when so doing, a clicking 
noise, similar to the sound of a shutter operating, 
could be produced, so that if the trigger should 
be then immediately released, it might be pos 
sible to fail to operate the shutter. This condi 
tion very seldom occurred, but, in order to pre 
vent it from occurring, careful assembly and 
timing of the time when the unwanted noise 
occurred had to be done in the factory, adding 
expense to the camera. A certain number of 
cameras could not be timed to prevent this noise 
which occurred when the spring arms locking 
the trigger dropped from an inoperative position, 
shown in the patent in Fig. 11, to the position 
shown in Fig. 12. My present invention is par 
ticularly directed to eliminating any noise what 
soever on the downward motion of the trigger 
so that the above di?iculty cannot occur. I 
have eliminated this possibility by transferring 
the objectionable noise of the locking levers 
(which must occur at some time during the op 
eration of the shutter unless expensive and com 
plicated means are employed to prevent the 
noise) from the downward stroke of the push 
button to the return stroke of the push button 
so that no noise occurs until the exposure is 
made. Since the noise can only occur after the 
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exposure is made, the shutter cannot be improp 
erly operated even by an inexperienced operator. 
While it is obvious that various different push 
button type shutters may be employed with my 
invention, the Hutchison shutter, shown in the 
second-mentioned patent, was designed for the 
camera herein illustrated and is entirely satis 
factory. I, therefore, prefer to use this shutter 
as illustrating an embodiment of my invention. 
Coming now to the drawings wherein like ref 

erence characters denote like parts throughout: 
Fig. 1 is a side elevation shown partially in 

section illustrating a preferred embodiment of 
my invention; 

Fig. 2 is a sectional view taken on line 2-—2 
of Fig. 1; 

Fig. 3 is a fragmentary sectional view showing 
the shutter rod and associated mechanism and 
its connection with a camera shutter; 

Fig. 4 is a schematic view of the shutter lock 
ing members in a latched position which they 
assume after an exposure has been made and 
before a film has been wound; 

Fig. 5 is a fragmentary sectional View of parts 
shown in Fig. 4, the trigger being pushed in par 
tially and being latched against operation; 

Fig. 6 is a view similar to Fig. 4, but with the 
trigger shown in an inward position releasing 
the shutter and making an exposure; 

Fig. '7 is a view similar to Fig. 5 but with the 
parts in the position for releasing the shutter; 

Fig. 8 is a view similar to Fig. 6 with the trigger 
released, as occurs after a ?lm has been wound; 

Fig. 9 ‘is a view similar to Fig. 7 but with the 
trigger in position to make an exposure; 

Fig. 10 is a view similar to Fig. 8 showing the 
locking levers in the position they assume after 
a partial turn of the winding key has been made, 
releasing one arm from its locking position; and 

Fig. 11 is a view similar to Fig. 9 but with the 
trigger still latched after only one lever has been 
released. 
My invention is for an improvement over the 

double-exposure prevention device shown in the 
first above-mentioned Hutchison patent, the 
improvement being primarily directed to chang 
ing the time of the latching noise as the shutter 
rod is operated from occurring on the down 
ward motion of the shutter rod, as happened in 
the Hutchison patent, to a noise which can only 
occur after the shutter trigger has been fully 
depressed and released. Consequently, since the 
noise may only occur on the releasing stroke, the 
operator cannot be fooled into believing that an 
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been completed. ‘In addition, it will be noticed 
that my improvement over Hutchison has elim 
inated a shutter-operating spring which was 
formerly necessary and has made it possible to 
reduce the length of the trigger rod. A friction 
washer has been added to produce the lost mo 
tion between the collar and the push button and 
trigger rod. This lost motion occurs in both di 
rections since, during the ?rst pressure upon 
the push button, the collar will remain stationary 
until engaged by the push button, at which time 
both the collar and push button will move to 
gether. After an exposure has been made, the 
spring 42 thrusts the second collar member 40 
outwardly until it engages the ?rst collar mem 
ber 31 so that here, again, the ?rst collar 31 is 
frictionally held until positively engaged by the 
second collar member 40. This enables the trig 
ger 3| to separate from the collar 3'! so that the 
resilient portions 21 and 28 of the latching levers 
may move into a latching position which pre 
vents effective movement of the trigger 3|, even 
though some movement is prevented. These 
latching levers prevent the trigger from mov 
ing a distance sufficient to either operate the '~ 
shutter or to interfere with the above-mentioned 
cycle of operations. 
Double exposures are not usually desired, but 

on occasion for trick photography they may be 
useful. In order to permit this, as indicated in 
Fig. l, a slide member 60 is normally pressed 
outwardly by a spring 6|. This slide has an up 
turned handle 62 on one end and a pair of 
flanges 63, 64 on the opposite end. These ?anges 
may engage tapered wall 65 and 66 on the re 
silient portions 21 and 28 of the levers so that 
these levers may be manually cammed apart to 
release the trigger without turning the ?lm 
winding knob l0. Thus, if desired, two exposures 
may be made on one ?lm. However, this mecha 
nism is not often used. 
When an operator wishes to make an exposure, 

the push button 3| is depressed, moving inwardly 
until it engages the collar 31. Since the resilient 
latching arms 21 and 28 are then engaged on the 
smooth periphery of the collar 31, they are mere 
ly transferred to the smooth periphery 32 of the 
push button 3|, this movement occurring silent 
ly as the trigger is moved inwardly. When an 
exposure has been completed, the spring 42 
moves the push button 3| outwardly before the 
collar 31 moves so that the resilient portions 21 
and 26 may then snap down successively, or to 
gether, into their latching position from which 
they may be released by winding a fresh area of 
?lm into place, or, in exceptional circumstances, 
from which they may be released by the slide 62. 

I prefer a friction washer of leather, rubber 
(real or arti?cial), ?ber, or felt, since such 
washers may also be used to seal 011-‘ light from 
the trigger aperture to the inside of the shutter. 
However, metal frictional members are quite 
satisfactory and a double-click stop may be 
employed if light leak is not a problem. "Fric 
tional member,” as used in the claims, is to in 
clude a member having frictional contact with 
the trigger for retarding operation thereof of 
any of the types mentioned above or equivalents 
thereof. 

I claim: 
1. An improvement in double exposure preven 

tion devices for roll-holding cameras of the type 
including a camera body, a ?lm-winding key post 
carrying a cam, .9. shutter, a shutter trigger for 
operating the shutter including a rod and a push 
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button on the end of the rod for releasing the 
shutter, a collar slidably mounted on the rod, 
a pair of levers both pivotally mounted on the 
camera body and provided with cam-engaging 
portions and resilient portions positioned to en 
gage and release the trigger and collar, said im 
provement comprising a frictional member car 
ried by the camera and engaging and tending 
to retard movement of the collar mounted on the 
rod, said collar being movable in one direction 
by the push button, and means carried by the 
rod for moving the collar in an opposite direc 
tion, said means and push button being spaced a 
distance greater than the length of the collar, 
the collar and push button having outer surfaces 
in alignment and positioned opposite the resil 
lent portions of the pair of lever arms and form 
ing smooth slideways on which the resilient por 
tions of the arms may slide when the edges of 
the collar and push button lie together, said col 
lar and push button being movable one against 
the other whereby the resilient portions of the 
levers may slide from one to the other when the 
push button is moved into contact with and 
moves the collar against the friction-a1 member 
carried by the camera, said push button being 
movable in a reverse direction while the collar 
is frictionally held, enabling the resilient por~ 
tions of the levers to drop down between the 
separated push button and collar, thereby lim 
iting inward movement of the push button. 

2. An improvement in double exposure preven 
tion devices for roll-holding cameras of the type 
including 9, camera body, a ?lm-winding key post 
carrying a cam, a shutter, a shutter trigger for 
operating the shutter including a rod and a 
push button on the end of the rod for releasing 
the shutter, a collar slidably mounted on the 
rod, a pair of levers both pivotally mounted on 
the camera body and provided with cam-engag 
ing portions and resilient portions positioned to 
engage and release the trigger and collar, said 
improvement comprising a lost motion connec 
tion between the collar and trigger rod, said 
collar being engageable and movable in one di 
rection by the push button and being engage 
able and movable in an opposite direction by a 
second collar fastened to the trigger rod, means 
carried by the camera body tending to restrain 
movement of the collar in both directions, a 
spring tending to thrust the collar and trigger 
outwardly into a rest position, the collar and 
push button including exterior walls positioned 
for engagement by the resilient portions of the 
pair of lever arms and forming when the collar 
and push button lie together, continuous smooth 
slideways on which said resilient portions of the 
lever arms may slide, said collar and push but 
ton being adapted to move relative to each other 
to engage so that the exterior walls of one may 
lie against and form a continuation of the ex 
terior walls of the other, said resilient portions 
of the levers being adapted to engage and move 
over the slideways formed by the exterior walls 
of both the collar and the push button, the col 
lar having a normal rest position spaced from 
the push button in which position the resilient 
lever portions may engage the external walls of 
the collar when said pivotally mounted levers 
are moved to an unlatching position by the cam 
on the winding key post whereby said resilient 
portions of the levers may remain on the collar 
until the push button is moved to engage the 
push button and collar and to move the collar 
so that the ?exible portions of the levers will 
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move from the.- collar to; the push‘ button; along 
the slideways thereof" during the,» downward 
movement of the push button to, make, an‘ ex: 
posure. 

3. The improvementv in double exposure pre 
vention devices for roll-:holding cameras de?ned 
in claim 2 characterized in that there is: a look: 
ing shoulder at the point, Where the push but: 
ton joins the trigger rod against which. they resil 
ient portions of, thelevers. may snap intoa latch 
ing position. as the‘ push button is released to be 
moved outwardly by the pressure of the spring 
and before the collar is moved: by‘ thev second 
collar on the trigger rod. 

4. The improvement in double; exposure pree 
vention devices for roll-holding cameras de?ned 
in claim 2 characterized by a tapered shoulder 

V on the push button extending downwardly, toe 
ward the trigger rod, a complemental shaped 
recess formed in- the end of the collar so that 
when said push button engages the collar the 
exterior walls of the collar and push button 
form one continuous surface‘ on which saidresil 
ient portions of the levers may slide and where 
by said resilient lever portions may slide. down 
a tapered extension on the push button and 
into a locking position between the trigger and 
the collar as the push button moves to a, normal 
rest position. 

5. The improvement in double exposure pre 
vention devices for roll-holding cameras'de?ned 
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claim 2 characterized in that thelostgmotion 
connection; between; the; collar and; trigger rod 
comprises. a friction device; mounted; onv the 
camera and engaging the; collar; for;v retarding 
movement of the. collar in either of two direc 
tions. 

6; The improvement, in; double exposure‘ preg 
vention. devices, for roll-holding cameras; defined 
in claim2 characterized in‘ that the lost; motion 
connection between the collar; and trigger: rod 
comprises a. friction device, mounted‘ on the 
camera and" engaging- the; collar for: retarding 
movement of: the collar, in; either‘ of two, direce 
tions, said friction device comprising a friction 
member engaging» exterior walls of- the: collar. 
said friction washer being ?xedly‘ attached to 
the camera body.v 

7; The improvement in- double‘ exposure pre 
vention devices’ for. rolleholdingl cameras» de?ned 
in, claim 2 characterized‘ by, the’v second; collar 
a?ixed to the trigger rod. and: the; push: button 
carried; by the trigger rod being spaced a dis; 
tance greater than the length: of: the‘_ ?rst-men 
tioned collar whereby movementv of the‘ trigger 
rod in‘ either direction may; take- place without 
moving the, collar and whilethe collar is fric 
tionally retained by a friction; device mounted 
on the camerabody. 
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